
Subject: RE: Bills uploaded
From: Robert Buente </o=ExchangeLabs/ou=Exchange Administrative Group
(FYDIBOHF23SPDLT)/cn=Recipients/cn=c7b1814176124b59b21d8fda30e507d8-
bbuente>
Date: 09/06/2017 12:29 PM
To: 'Ellen Riotto' <ellen@southpark.la>, Marcus Lieber
<Marcus.Lieber@armaninoLLP.com>

Ellen:

Bob leaves tomorrow so if Marcus can review and approve I’ll sign off today.  Just send me 
an email so I know to open up Bill.com  Otherwise it will probably be Monday before I 
approve the invoices.

Robert Buente

President/CEO

1010 Development Corporation

1001 South Hope Street

Los Angeles, CA  91105

213-749-0214 x202

bbuente@1010dev.org

From: Ellen Riotto [mailto:ellen@southpark.la] 
Sent: Wednesday, September 6, 2017 12:24 PM
To: Marcus Lieber <Marcus.Lieber@armaninoLLP.com>
Cc: Robert Buente <bbuente@1010dev.org>
Subject: Bills uploaded

Hi Marcus,

FYI, bills have been uploaded to bill.com, including the Blue Shield bill, which has been 
auto-paid. 
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Bob is out of town for his wedding and I’m sure he won’t be able to approve the invoices – 
is there a workaround so we can avoid late payments?

Thanks,

Ellen

Ellen Riotto 

Executive Director

South Park Business Improvement District

1100 S Flower St, Suite #3400, Los Angeles, CA 90015

ellen@southpark.la <mailto:ellen@southpark.la>  | o. 213 663 1112 | c. 401 439 8147

southpark.la <http://www.southpark.la/>  | Facebook <http://fb.com/SouthParkLosAngeles>  | 
Twitter <https://twitter.com/southparkla>  | Instagram <https://www.instagram.com
/southparkla/>
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